
Learning steps: 
Step 1:  How many kinds of 
pilgrimages there are? 
Step 2:  What happens during a 
pilgrimage? 
Step 3:  What constitute a pilgrimage? 
Step 4:  How does one become a 
pilgrim? 

 
Step 1:  How many kinds of 
pilgrimages there are? 
  
Thoughts: 
Examine all the different forms of 
pilgrimages. 
How do they get attraction from 
people? 
How did they begin with what kind of 
motivation? 
Why do people go on pilgrimage? 
  
Actions: 
Come up with examples in real life 
that can stimulate the spirit of 
pilgrimage. 
Write / draw a clear, concise, 
compelling answer to the question, 
What is pilgrimage?”  

 

Step 2:  What happens during a 
pilgrimage? 
  
Thoughts: 
Where and when does the pilgrimage 
happen? 
What happens after the pilgrims get 
there?  
How does the rest of the local 
community act? 
  
Actions: 
Design / describe the mechanism of a 
pilgrimage. 
Can you think of a way to separate the 
pilgrimage from ordinary life? 
What kind of sensor can you build to 
measure the degree of participation in 
a pilgrimage? 
How to identify the intention of people 
joining a pilgrimage? 
 

 
 
 
Step 3:  What constitute a pilgrimage? 
  
Thoughts: 
What are the characteristic actions of a 
pilgrim? 
  
Actions: 
Build a sensor to measure the effect of 
a pilgrimage on a person. 
 
 
 
 



Step 4:  How does one become a 
pilgrim? 
  
Thoughts: 
What kind of benefit one gets from a 
pilgrimage?  
What happens to the mind and the 
body of a pilgrim? 
What kind of sacrifice one has to make 
to be a pilgrim? 
How does a pilgrimage effect the 
attitude and behavior of a person? 
 

 
 
Actions: 
Go on a pilgrimage. 
Organize a pilgrimage. 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 


